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Re: Summer internship under your supervision. 

Rajendra Prasad 

Sat 28-Apr-18 11:21 AM 

To: 

• atul roy <royatul11@gmail.com> 

Cc: 

• Dr Rajendra Prasad <rprasad@ggn.amity.edu> 

NO problem. 
remind me few days in advance so I book hostel for you. 
No problem. 
rp 
 

 

Rajendra Prasad, Ph.D, FNASc, FASc, FNA              

Dean,  Faculty of Science,Engineering  and Technology 

Director, Amity Institute of Integrative Sciences and Health 

Director, Amity Institute of Biotechnology 

Amity University Haryana, 

Amity Education Valley 

Gurgaon-122413 

India 

email: rprasad@ggn.amity.edu 

 

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.  

 

On Sat, Apr 28, 2018 at 11:14 AM, atul roy <royatul11@gmail.com> wrote: 

Sir  

Since the internship day is coming near, please inform me about the accommodation.  

Thank you.  

 

On Sat, 10 Feb 2018, 10:19 am atul roy, <royatul11@gmail.com> wrote: 

I can join by 21st may to 16th of July.   

Is there any reference material or books which I should refer during internship? 

Do provide me any of your contact number to stay in your touch. Also let me know exact location of your 

lab.  

Thank you.  

 

On 10 Feb 2018 5:02 am, "Rajendra Prasad" <rp47jnu@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes you can come 
tell me date etc so I can book accommodation for you 
rp 
 

 

Rajendra Prasad, Ph.D, FNASc, FASc, FNA              

Dean,  Faculty of Science,Engineering  and Technology 

Director, Amity Institute of Integrative Sciences and Health 

mailto:rprasad@ggn.amity.edu
mailto:royatul11@gmail.com
mailto:royatul11@gmail.com
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Director, Amity Institute of Biotechnology 

Amity University Haryana, 

Amity Education Valley 

Gurgaon-122413 

India 

email: rprasad@ggn.amity.edu 

 

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.  

 

On Fri, Feb 9, 2018 at 11:44 PM, atul roy <royatul11@gmail.com> wrote: 

With due  respect sir.I want to know about confirmation on internship so that I can inform the same to my 

department head. And also to do the prebooking of tickets.  

Thank you.  

 

 

On 27 Jan 2018 5:50 pm, "atul roy" <royatul11@gmail.com> wrote: 
With due respect sir. I want to state that, according to DST inspire programme, I will be paid 20000 after the completion of 
internship by department of science and technology to bear the expenditure cost during that time . For which my department 
head Shushanta Ghosh will connect you and will ask your approval. Its my humble request to do this favour for me.   
Thank you. 

 

On 27 Jan 2018 7:03 am, "Rajendra Prasad" <rp47jnu@gmail.com> wrote: 

There is no expense involved in training. 
The money you require for your living expenses,I mean. 
Hopefully accommodation will be free. 
stay in touch. 
rp 
 

 

Rajendra Prasad, Ph.D, FNASc, FASc, FNA              

Dean,  Faculty of Science,Engineering  and Technology 

Director, Amity Institute of Integrative Sciences and Health 

Director, Amity Institute of Biotechnology 

Amity University Haryana, 

Amity Education Valley 

Gurgaon-122413 

India 

email: rprasad@ggn.amity.edu 

 

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.  

 

On Fri, Jan 26, 2018 at 10:06 PM, atul roy <royatul11@gmail.com> wrote: 

After the completion of semester examination, which will be finished by third  week of May, I will able to 

visit you sir.  

 

On 26 Jan 2018 9:53 pm, "atul roy" <royatul11@gmail.com> wrote: 

The maximum time period will be of 6-8 weeks.   

And please do inform me about approx expenditure to finish internship.  

 

On 26 Jan 2018 8:25 pm, "Rajendra Prasad" <rp47jnu@gmail.com> wrote: 

Fine 
Let me know what time period. 
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We can give you accommodation but you should have money to 
support yourself. 
rp 
 

 

Rajendra Prasad, Ph.D, FNASc, FASc, FNA              

Dean,  Faculty of Science,Engineering  and Technology 

Director, Amity Institute of Integrative Sciences and Health 

Director, Amity Institute of Biotechnology 

Amity University Haryana, 

Amity Education Valley 

Gurgaon-122413 

India 

email: rprasad@ggn.amity.edu 

 

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.  

 

On Fri, Jan 26, 2018 at 7:49 PM, atul roy <royatul11@gmail.com> wrote: 
Dear sir/mam  
I am studying at ISERC in shantiniketan in viswa bharti University, presently in 1st year of 5year integrated M. Sc 
programme, Having DST - INSPIRE fellowship from department of science and technology.  
I want to have my summer internship under your supervision in order to explore more.  
I am attaching my resume with this mail and hoping for your call for confirmation.  
Thank you 
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